




Bid No. 5090-2013 
Description: Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) and Diesel Engines 
Department: Transportation 
Opening Date: May 17, 2012 @ 2:00 p.m. 

Item # Engine Model / Make 
Price Per Unit 

Estimated 
Quantity 
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1 DT-360/ Navistar 1 NO BID $7,576.00 NO BID NO BID $7,488.85 

2 DT-408 / Navistar 1 NO BID $8,560.00 NO BID NO BID $7,087.26 

3  DTA-466 / Navistar 6 NO BID $8,934.00 $11,310.65 $6,449.20 $8,959.93 

4  ISC 8.3 / Cummins Diesel 6 $14,107.02 
$13,600.00 

NO BID NO BID NO BID $14,656.00 

5 3126E / Caterpillar 6 NO BID $12,775.00 $13,259.65 $12,903.75 NO BID 

6 DTA-466E / Navistar 10 NO BID $10,550.00 $10,642.04 $12,150.00 $6,359.93 

7 DT-444E / Navistar 2 NO BID $7,623.00 $7,019.29 $11,587.50 $6,682.24 

8 MEB-900 / Detroit Diesel 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11,857.37 NO BID 

9 CNG-ISL-G-280-350HP / Cummins CNG 2 $32,253.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
 

Failure To File A Protest Within The Time Prescribed In Section 120.57, F.S., Shall Constitute A Waiver Of Proceedings Under Chapter 120, F.S. And Board Policy 6.09."  Offers 
From The Vendors Listed Herein Are The Only Offers Received Timely As Of The Above Opening Date And Time. All Other Offers Submitted In Response To This Solicitation, If 
Any, Are Hereby Rejected As Late." 

 

Opened By: June Kail Date: May 17, 2012 Recorded By: Nancy Scott Date: May 17, 2012 
 




